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The DBU Women’s Auxiliary Board celebrated two 
annual events this past Spring – the Bluebonnet 

Luncheon, held on April 8, and the Membership Tea, held 
on May 4. 
	 Members of the DBU Women’s Auxiliary Board 
gathered together in the Great Hall of the Mahler Student 
Center to celebrate the annual Bluebonnet Luncheon. 
Bobbie Pinson, who currently serves on the DBU Board 
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of Trustees, was the chair of the luncheon committee, 
while Cynthia Davis, Pam Hall, Dr. Nell Hoffman, Ann 
Kelley, Virgie Mangham, Betty Rush, Raleigh Mae 
Stevenson, Phyllis Tresnicky, and Carolyn Wicker served 
as committee members. 

During the luncheon, special tribute was paid to Mrs. 
Sheila Cook for 27 years of service as First Lady at DBU, 
while also honoring the graduating international students 
at Dallas Baptist University. Dr. and Mrs. Cook’s sons, 
David, who serves at DBU as an assistant professor 
of leadership and director of the M.A. in Leadership 
program, and Mark Cook, who serves as the program 
coordinator for the Institute for Global Engagement, both 
spoke and shared stories about their mother’s ministry 
both as a parent and First Lady.

This year’s Membership Tea was held in the beautiful 
home of Art and Linda Alexander, longtime friends of 
DBU.   

The committee members of the event included Anita 
Jones, Carol Hindes, Sandy Owen, Leslie Moulton, May 
Beth Smith, Carolyn Garon, and Marjanna Thomas. 

For more information on the Women’s Auxiliary Board, 
please contact Candice Wright, WAB executive director, 
via email at candice@dbu.edu.
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